Lubricant

Motor Oil (15w
40 Rotella low
Company Soot) Anti Freeze Trans Send Notes
Thomas Oil Co no bid no bid no bid
McPherson Companies |$12.44 $6.94|50/50 $15.63
Cherry Log Petrolium $9.95 $9.95 $19.95
(not TranSynd,
Cadence Petrolium $9.29 $3.95|50/50 $23.69|disqualfied)
FUEL
Company Diesel Ethonal Free Gasoline
Thomas Oil Co No Bid No Bid
Colonial 0.0725 0.0456
Petroleum Traders Corp [0.0174 0.0314
Propane
Company Gallon
Ferrel Gas $1.450
Appalachian Propane  [$1.249
Fort Mtn Propane $1.410
MJ Propane $1.180

NOTE: Yellow highlight indicates winning bid




